
6TH-11TH  FEBRUARY, 2023

HYDERABAD-E-MOBILITY WEEK
DRIVING TO A SUSTAINABLE  FUTURE

The Hyderabad e-Mobility Week will be organized by the Government of the Indian State of Telangana
from 6-11 February 2023 at Hyderabad, India.  Hyderabad is all set to become the first city in India to host
Formula E race on 11th February 2023.  

Several exciting events have been planned during the week to showcase the global EV ecosystem and
promote the adoption of clean and sustainable mobility. These include Hyderabad EV Summit, the Rall-E
Hyderabad, and the Hyderabad E-Motor Show culminating with the Hyderabad E-Prix.  A copy of the
event  brochure  is  attached for  your  perusal.  More  details  are  available
at http://www.evhyderabad.in/. Some of the key highlights of the celebrations include:

•  EV Summit (6th February 2023): This will be the curtain raiser event and will feature industry leaders,
policymakers, academics, and other dignitaries engaged in talks and panel discussions around the future
of  sustainable  mobility  and  the  role  of  EV  and  other  emerging  technologies  in  shaping  it.  Venue:
Hyderabad  International  Convention  Centre  Near  Hitec  City,  Kondapur,  Telangana-500081  Contact
details:  Mr.  Gopalakrishnan V.C.,  Director  Automotive & EV,  Industries & Commerce Dept,  Govt.  of
Telangana Email: dir-automtv-ind@telangana.gov.in , Tel: +91 6379968974

• Rall-E Hyderabad (7th February 2023): This will be the first-of-its-kind electric bike rally showcasing the
depth of EV adoption and sending a message about sustainability. Venue: Hitex Exhibition Centre, Trade
Fair Office Building, Izzathnagar, Hyderabad, Telangana-500084 Contact details: Ms. Bhavya Vatrapu,
VP  Strategic  Partnerships,  Office  of  Chief  Relations  Officer,  Govt  of  Telangana  E-mail:
bhavya.vatrapu@gmail.com , cro@telangana.gov.in Tel: +91 8291043901

• Hyderabad E-Motor Show (8th and 9th February 2023): In this trendsetting electric car and bike expo,
leading electric OEMs, startups and ecosystem partners will showcase their latest models, products and
services. Venue: Hitex Exhibition Centre, Trade Fair Office Building, Izzathnagar, Hyderabad, Telangana-
500084 Contact details: Mr. Aaditya Sudhakar K., Joint Director, Electronics Wing, ITE&C Dept, Govt of
Telangana E-mail: bdev-es-itc@telangana.gov.in , Tel:+91 7396056686
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•  Hyderabad E-Prix (10th and 11th February 2023): The first-ever Formula E race in India, will see 22
drivers from 11 teams fight it out for victory around the Hyderabad Street Circuit near the iconic Necklace
Road. With this event, Hyderabad will join the prestigious list of E-Prix host cities such as New York,
London, Berlin, Seoul,  Monaco, and Rome. Venue: Necklace Road, Hyderabad, Contact E-mail:  hyd-
eprix@aceurbanrace.com , hyderabadeprix@aceurbanrace.com

Telangana is striving to be ahead of the curve in adopting green mobility technologies. Telangana is one
of the first states in India to launch a dedicated EV & ESS policy in 2020 and have taken a number of
initiatives to provide an end-to-end ecosystem for driving the EV revolution in the state and in the
country. It has already attracted investments from key EV companies such as Fisker, Olectra, Hyundai,
Biliti Electric and ZF Group. It will be soon launching the Telangana E-Mobility Valley to promote further
investments and innovations in this sunrise sector.

All those interested are encouraged to participate in the above events.

For any question or assistance, please feel free to contact Commercial team at the Embassy of India at
(51-1) 460-2289 E-mail: ccom.lima@mea.gov.in , com1.lima@mea.gov.in , com2.lima@mea.gov.in 
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